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Registration Ends 
July 31 at 11:59 PM

exhibitions.artistscollectivespartanburg.org

Artists Collective | Spartanburg in Spartanburg, SC invites 
all visual artists, 18 years and older, residing in South 
Carolina, North Carolina, Virginia, Georgia, and Tennessee 
to apply for acceptance to the 2025 Annual Juried 
Exhibition.

Entries will be accepted Tues July 1 - Thur July 31, 2025 
at exhibitions.artistscollectivespartanburg.org

This is the seventh regional, juried exhibition presented by 
the Collective to showcase the amazing diversity of work 
within this southern region.

The exhibition will take place within the 
Solomon Gallery at Artists Collective | Spartanburg.

Artist, educator, author

This Year’s Juror

Dwight Rose

South Carolina, North Carolina, Virgina, Georgia, and Tennessee

Calling All Visual Artists in the Five State Area

in the Five State Area

Calling All Visual Artists

First Place - $2500

Second Place - $1000

Third Place - $500

Merit Awards - $1000+

578 West Main Street, 
Spartanburg, SC
(864) 804-6501

Dwight Rose is a professional artist, specializing in painting 
and teaching watercolor. After graduating with a BFA in 
painting from the Ringling College of Art and Design, he 
began his career in Sarasota, Florida. Exhibiting in local 
galleries, his paintings were recognizable with images of 
tropical landscapes and historic homes. Teaching for 
Ringling College, he later expanded his courses to 
community and museum programs.

In 2001 – 2007, Dwight lived in Doha, Qatar and traveled 
internationally. He captured images of the Middle East, 
China, Thailand, India, and many other countries. Once 
again in the college classroom, he enjoyed his diverse 
students. Exhibiting in Qatar, Turkey, and in the USA, his 
work is enjoyed and collected by an international audience.

ANNUAL JURIED EXHIBITION

https://exhibitions.artistscollectivespartanburg.org/

